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ASHLAND MASONIC LODGE PRQCLAMATIOM

WHEREAS, On May 3, 2019 at 6 o'clock P.M. Ashland Masonic Lodge
No. 1138 will celebrate their 100'^ birthday; and

WHEREAS, Ashland Masonic Lodge has faithfully and fraternally
served the Community of New Diana (Ashland) and Upshur County
for the last 100 years.

WHEREAS, most of this Lodges 122 members live locally and live
throughout this great Nation and those that are available take pride
in taking part in the local events of the Diana Community School
District providing meals and Scholarships each year to a graduating
New Diana high School graduate, and

WHEREAS, Masonic Lodges are and have been instrumental in
providing and supporting Public Education throughout The history of
Texas, and

WHEREAS, Masons have served in a great capacity in our American
History: Our first President George Washington being a distinguished
Mason who, along with fellow Masons and Patriots Benjamin Franklin,
Patrick Henry, Paul Revere, James Madison, Marquis de Lafayette,
and many other notable Masons helped establish this great Country,
and

WHEREAS, Masons have served and sacrifice in the founding and
building of this great STATE of TEXAS, including every President and
Vice President of the Republic of Texas: such notable Masons as
Stephen F. Austin, William Barrett Travis, David Crocket, Jim Bowie,
MIrabeau B. Lamar, Lorenzo de Zavala, Charles Goodnight, Audie
Murphy, Sam Rayburn, and Lloyd Bentsen.

NOW, THEREFORE, I County Judge Todd Tefteller, by virtue of the
authority vested in me as County Judge of Upshur County and on
behalf of the Commissioners Court do hereby proclaim

NOVEMBER 6, 2019

AS

"ASHLAND MASONIC LODGE N0.1138 DAY"

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have set my hand and caused the
Seal of Upshur County to be affixed onjtils the l^t Day of

May, 2019 "
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Todd Tefteller; Upshur County Judge


